LAW OFFICES

Zukowski, Rogers, Flood & McArdle 50 VIRGINIA STREET Crystal Lake, Illinois 60014 (815) 459-2050 fax (815) 459-9057

March 10, 2020

Village of Lakewood ATTN: Village Administration 2500 Lake Avenue Lakewood, IL 60014

Billed Through: 02/29/2020
Client Number: 001126 MJS

Invoice Number: 141983

Matter 00001

Traffic: Settlement and trial of traffic litigation regarding the Village of Lakewood

02/03/2020	drafting of witness letter for Defendant, Hoffman for Courtroom 102;	0.25	
02/03/2020	court appearance in Room 104;	1.00	
02/10/2020	receipt and review of State's Attorney DUI numbers; edit direct	0.50	hrs
02/10/2020	examination for Macovei and send same to Wiegel to review; preparation		
	for Room 301;		
02/11/2020	court appearance for Bench Trial re Jorge Chavez;	3.00	
02/11/2020	prepare for Room 104;	0.25	
02/11/2020	court appearance in Room 301;	0.50	hrs
02/11/2020	correspondence to Attorney Boscoianu enclosing documents received	0.25	hrs
02/12/2020	from IDOT pursuant to subpoena;		
02/12/2020	conference with Officer Weigel giving notice of 3-10-20 MTS hearing re	0.25	hrs
02/12/2020	Rodion Macouvei;		
02/12/2020	drafting of pretrial statement re Macovei;		hrs
02/13/2020	receipt and review of motion in limine and motion to suppress re	2.00	hrs
02/15/2020	Macovei: court appearance in Room 104;		
02/13/2020	court appearance in Room 301 for pretrial re Macovei;		hrs
02/17/2020	prepare for Room 301;		hrs
02/18/2020	court appearance in Room 301;	0.25	5 hrs
02/18/2020	receipt and review of motion to reconsider re Jones motion to suppress	2.50) hrs
02/16/2020	ruling; drafting of response to motion to dismiss and motion to quash;		
02/19/2020	drafting of motion for protective order for medical records re Scott;		5 hrs
02/19/2020	preparation for court in Room 301 on 2/20;	0.2	5 hrs
02/19/2020	correspondence with officer re his review of facts in response to motion to	1.2	5 hrs
02/20/2020	suppress; edit response; court appearance in Room 104;		
02/20/2020	court appearance in Room 301; preparation for court in Room 301 on	1.0	0 hrs
02/20/2020	2/21;		

		PAGE	2
Lakewood	W. Maranoi, research case law	1.50	hrs
02/21/2020	drafting of response to motion in limine #1 re Macovei; research case law		
	na nama!	0,50	
02/21/2020	court appearance in Room 301; follow up from same; correspondence with officer re motion to admit provisions re Macovei; correspondence with officer re motion to admit provisions re Macovei;	0.75	hrs
02/24/2020	drafting of responses to motions; review case law re "search" pursuant to		
	weighing of vehicle; telephone call to offer re same;	0.50	hrs
00/06/0000	t' Con count in Room 104'	0.30	
02/26/2020	to the and from Kane County's police department to Europe	1.00	
02/27/2020	edit responses to motions and draft motion to amend re overweight re	1.00	
02/2/12020	Gross:	0.25	hrs
02/27/2020	preparation for court in Room 301 on 2/28;	0.75	
02/27/2020	tion for and 102 court on 02/28/20;	0.50	
02/28/2020	correspondence with attorney for defendant re filing motions, manage		
02,20,20	responses re Macovel;	0.50	hrs
02/28/2020	court appearance in Room 301; follow up from same;	2.00	hrs
02/28/2020	court appearance in Room 501, follow appearance; telephone call to conference with Officer Wiegel; 102 court appearance; telephone call to Donahue & Walsh, and Atty. Jazwiec re overweight plea;		
	Donahue & Walsh, and Atty. Jazwice to dreaming I	** ***	
Total Fees For This Matter 23.25 hrs		\$2,906.25	
Total rees	S POL TIMS IVIANO		
	00013 Miscellaneous:		
Matter	00013	0.75	hua
02/03/20	20 receipt and review of correspondence from Village Clerk re notaries	0.75	hrs
02/03/20	a titul analyses come!	1.50	hrs
02/03/20	legislation, analyze same, Revise development agreement to encompass timeframe for investment of		
	resources in property, Village's right to re-acquired property; receipt and review of initial draft of RedTail agreement with Crystal Lake	0.25	hrs
02/03/20	receipt and review of initial dialt of Red an agreement Wight		
00/02/2	Central High; revise agreement with Crystal Lake Central golf teams based on	0.25	hrs
02/03/2	Chief Administrative Officer,	0.24	hua
02/04/2	200 correspondence with Village Clerk re amendments to Notary Act;		hrs hrs
02/04/2	Ded Toil Agreement with Crystal Lake Central,		5 hrs
02/05/2	the state of Administrative Children is all the state of the		
	to the start of th		
	Progrident re I agar zoning process, telephone can nom Attorney runten,		
	follow-up with Chief Administrative Officer re same,	0.5	0 hrs
02/07/2	2020 receipt and review of Board packet;		0 hrs
02/07/	2020 conference with Village Clerk re FOIA request for police report;		0 hrs
02/07/	di CA Iniziatestiva Officer re follow-un on building		0 hrs
02/10/	telephone call from Chief Administrative Officer to follow up of our and permit issues, redevelopment agreement;		
02/11/	talenhone call from developer's attorney, follow up with letter to Heritage	1.0	00 hrs
UZIIII	Title re Sportsplex Annexation Agreement exception on title communent;		00 1
02/11	/2020 receipt and review of correspondence from Tracey Annen with revised	1.0	00 hrs
	development agreement;		

		PAGE	3
Lakewood		0.25	hrs
02/12/2020	drafting of resolution adopting amended anti-harassment policy; revise policy per Public Act 101-0221; correspondence to client explaining	0.23	ms
	same:	0.25	hrs
02/12/2020	attendance at Roard of Trustee's meeting of 2/11/20;	0.25	
02/13/2020	correspondence with Chief Administrative Office re narassment poncy	Chille Maria Chill	
	and which version to use;	0.25	hrs
02/17/2020	conference with President;	0.25	
02/17/2020	review and comment re small cell ordinances and subsequent changes; telephone call from Chief Administrative Officer re various issues (sale of	0.50	hrs
02/18/2020	property, meeting with Joe Lazar, follow-up on zoning issue, personnel);		
00/10/2020	telephone call from Chief Administrative Officer, review (quickly) one	0.75	hrs
02/19/2020	inch pile of pleadings for hearing on Stroud foreclosure;	0.25	hrs
02/20/2020	undate manual:	0.25	
02/20/2020	receipt and review of articles of incorporation; forward to Chief	0.23	
	A desinistrative Officer	0.50	hrs
02/20/2020	conferences with Chief Administrative Officer; analyze case invalidating		
	fire services agreement; revisions to development agreement with Lazar Brothers based on	1.25	hrs
02/20/2020	convergation with Chief Administrative Officer,		
02/21/2020	finalize changes to development agreement; telephone call from Village	1.25	hrs
02/21/2020	Clark re procedural issue:	1.50) hrs
02/25/2020	2 CAO to redevelopment agreement, revisions to	1.50	, 1113
	development agreement, begin drafting public hearing house, review		
	zoning code in connection with Lazar development;	0.73	5 hrs
02/25/2020	10 to the letter for Lozar contract: dialling of	1.50	0 hrs
02/26/2020	changes to develonment agreement, zoning nouce,		
02/27/2020	confrance with Chief Administrative Officer re ADA issues, Lazar	0.2	5 hrs
02/2/12020	t all amont timing of notice for zoning hearing;	2.5	0 hrs
02/27/2020	11 Come I again attorney re various issues, review of extension	2.3	U IIIS
02/2//	letter from Lazar attorney, finalize zoning notice for review by Chief Administrative Officer; telephone call from Chief Administrative Officer		
	t interior government igning college college thom vinage cities,		
	Chief Administrative Officer, telephone calls from Chief Administrative		
	Officer;		
		\$2.050.00	1
Total Fees l	For This Matter 22.00 hrs	\$3,850.00	J
COSTS AD	VANCED	\$79.8	2
02/02/2020	Northwest Herald - publisher's certificate for public notice re zoning		
	text amendment;		
Total Dichu	ursements For This Matter	\$79.8	2
Total Disut			
D** * ****	CHIMMADV		
BILLING	SUMMARY	\$6,756.2	25
TOTA	AL FEES 45.25 hrs	\$0,730.2	2.0

Lakewood

TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED TOTAL FOR THIS INVOICE

TOTAL BALANCE NOW DUE

PAGE

\$79.82

4

\$6,836.07

\$6,836.07

UNPAID BALANCES ARE SUBJECT TO A 1.5% PER MONTH DELINQUENCY CHARGE AFTER 30 DAYS FROM BILLING DATE.
VISA AND MASTERCARD ACCEPTED.