LAW OFFICES

Zukowski, Rogers, Flood & McArdle

50 VIRGINIA STREET

Crystal Lake, Illinois 60014

(815) 459-2050 fax (815) 459-9057

December 11, 2018

Village of Lakewood

ATTN: Village Administration

2500 Lake Avenue Lakewood, IL 60014

> Billed Through: 11/30/2018 Client Number: 001126 MJS

> > \$2,562.50

Invoice Number: 134947

Matter 00001

Total Fees For This Matter

Traffic: Settlement and trial of traffic litigation

20.50 hrs

regarding

the Village of Lakewood

ANCED Kenosha County Sheriff (service of summons and petition to revoke re Hamm)	\$40.00			
Total Disbursements For This Matter \$40.0				
013 Miscellaneous:				
telephone call from Chief Administrative Officer re zoning issues (solar), personnel matters, follow up on same;	0.75 hrs			
receipt and review of correspondence from Chief Administrative Officer repolitical gathering at Red Tail;	0.25 hrs			
receipt and review of correspondence from Chief Administrative Officer, conference with Chief Administrative Officer;	1.00 hrs			
receipt and review of correspondence from Chief Administrative Officer to Lazar Brothers, C. Brockeman;	0.25 hrs			
telephone call from Village Clerk re meeting;	0.25 hrs			
telephone call from Trustee, review of correspondence from Trustee, review Tort Immunity Act;	2.50 hrs			
telephone call from Chief Administrative Officer re social media policy; receipt and review of notice of motion on motion for summary judgment relative to 345 Cumberland;	0.75 hrs			
telephone call from Trustee;	1.00 hrs			
telephone call from Village Clerk re possible municipal code	0.50 hrs			
	re Hamm) ements For This Matter O13 Miscellaneous: telephone call from Chief Administrative Officer re zoning issues (solar), personnel matters, follow up on same; receipt and review of correspondence from Chief Administrative Officer re political gathering at Red Tail; receipt and review of correspondence from Chief Administrative Officer, conference with Chief Administrative Officer; receipt and review of correspondence from Chief Administrative Officer to Lazar Brothers, C. Brockeman; telephone call from Village Clerk re meeting; telephone call from Trustee, review of correspondence from Trustee, review Tort Immunity Act; telephone call from Chief Administrative Officer re social media policy; receipt and review of notice of motion on motion for summary judgment relative to 345 Cumberland; telephone call from Trustee;			

Lakewood		PAGE	2
	amendments, code violation follow up; receipt and review of correspondence from Village Clerk;		
11/09/2018	correspondence with lender's attorney regarding motion for summary judgment relative to 346 Cumbersome;	0.25	hrs
11/10/2018	receipt and review of Board packet;	0.50	hrs
11/12/2018	telephone call from Chief Administrative Officer re various issues; receipt and review of correspondence from attorney for lender on foreclosure on Cumbersome Lane; review of proposed judgment orders;	1.75	
11/13/2018	receipt and review of correspondence from Chief Administrative Officer re whether joint review board meeting necessary for closure, review of correspondence; follow up with attorney in connection with Frizzo v. City of Iron River litigation, follow up with lender attorney re liens;	0.75	
11/13/2018	attendance at Board of Trustees' meeting of November 13, 2018;	2.50	
11/14/2018	receipt and review of correspondence from Michigan law firm regarding declaration of service in connection with written deposition questions;	0.25	
11/14/2018	receipt and review of revised letter of intent from Chief Administrative Officer, respond to same; follow up on filing for Village liens for foreclosure on Cumberland, review correspondence from lender's attorney:	0.50	
11/14/2018	telephone call from Chief Administrative Officer re various items (letter of intent, sticker fee, municipal code changes); receipt and review of documents from lender's attorney in connection with Cumberland Lane foreclosure;	1.50	
11/14/2018	conference re leaf trademark and status of RedTail trademark issues;	0.25	
11/15/2018	receipt and review of Laura Frizzo complaint; follow up with Chief Administrative Officer regarding course of action;	0.50	
11/16/2018	telephone call from defense counsel;	0.50	
11/16/2018	receipt and review of correspondence from Charles Hervas re defense of	0.25	
11/18/2018	receipt and review of correspondence from Administrator re coverage of litigation by risk carrier, response to FOIA request by FOIA officer;	0.25	
11/18/2018	attendance at seminar for planning and zoning and parliamentary procedure;	2.00 1.25	
11/21/2018	telephone call from Chief Administrative Officer re tax levy, PTELL issues, fire protection tax;		hrs
11/27/2018	attendance at Board of Trustees meeting;		hrs
11/27/2018	review of trademark information; outlining of correspondence to Administrator Smith re same;		hrs
11/28/2018	receipt and review of correspondence from Sue Villie re notice of deposition questions in connection with Michigan litigation, respond thereto;		
11/28/2018	telephone call from Chief Administrative Officer re possible land offer, architectural review issues; follow up from Board meeting, request for solar power accessory by resident; follow up on Truth in Taxation issue, bed and breakfast, Air Bnb issue; conference with Chief Administrator Officer; conference with Clerk re SSA No. 5;	2.25	hrs
11/29/2018	receipt and review of correspondence from insurance carrier appointed attorney; review court decision cited in same;	0.25	hrs

Lakewood			PAGE	3
11/29/2018	receipt and review of correspondence from Chie re question from IDOT regarding land ownership parcels, correspondence from engineer, telephon Administrative Officer;	1.50	hrs	
11/29/2018	receipt and review of petition to utilize SSA No. improvement project, respond thereto; review co Village Clerk regarding cause of action;	5 for neighborhood entry orrespondence from	0,50	
11/30/2018	telephone call from Chief Administrative Office deposition of Village Clerk; follow up with State map, ownership of parcels at Route 47/Pleasant	1.25	hrs	
11/03/2018	telephone call from Chief Administrative Officer re unpermitted special event at Red Tail Golf Club, options for Village in connection with same;			hrs
11/04/2018	receipt and review of correspondence from Chie re unpermitted special event;	0.25	hrs	
Total Fees Fo	or This Matter	28.75 hrs	\$5,031.25	
BILLING S	UMMARY			
TOTA	L FEES 4	19.25 hrs	\$7,593.75	
	COSTS ADVANCED		\$40.00	
CLESS	PREPAID APPLIED)		\$3,093.75	T
	FOR THIS INVOICE		\$4,540.00	
TOTA	L BALANCE NOW DUE		\$4,540.00	

UNPAID BALANCES ARE SUBJECT TO A 1.5% PER MONTH DELINQUENCY CHARGE AFTER 30 DAYS FROM BILLING DATE. VISA AND MASTERCARD ACCEPTED.