LAW OFFICES

Zukowski, Rogers, Flood & McArdle 50 VIRGINIA STREET

Crystal Lake, Illinois 60014

(815) 459-2050 fax (815) 459-9057

September 9, 2019

Village of Lakewood ATTN: Village Administration

2500 Lake Avenue Lakewood, IL 60014

> Billed Through: 08/31/2019 Client Number: 001126 MJS

Invoice Number: 139040

Matter 00001 Traffic: Settlement and trial of traffic litigation regarding the Village of Lakewood

08/09/2009	correspondence to victim in Araugo-Ogamio, Emmauel Lu scene accident re possible restitution;	0.25	hrs
08/01/2019	court appearance in Room 104;	0.50	hrs
08/01/2019	court appearance in Rooms 301 and 303; prep file, trial sheet re Whapley; post prep court call for Rooms 301 and 303; prepare court call for Room 301; receipt and review of Reiner email from Defendant's attorney re offer; email Defendant's attorney on Reiner offer;	1.25	hrs
08/02/2019	court appearance in Room 301;	0.50	hrs
08/05/2019	post pre court call for Room 301; prepare court call for Room 301;	0.25	hrs
08/06/2019	court appearance in Room 301; post prep court call for Room 301;	0.50	hrs
08/07/2019	preparation for Room 104;	0.25	hrs
08/08/2019	court appearance in Room 104;	0.50	hrs
08/08/2019	correspondence with Officer Olszak re Verue; receipt and review of citation and complaint for defendant, Hughes;	0.25	hrs
08/12/2019	preparation for court in Room 301;	0.25	hrs
08/13/2019	court appearance in Room 301;	0.50	hrs
08/14/2019	preparation for court in Room 104;	0.50	hrs
08/15/2019	court appearance in Room 104;	0.75	hrs
08/15/2019	court appearance add on in 301; post prep court call 301; prepare court call 301 tomorrow; receipt and review of email from Public Defender re offer on Schiraldi;	0.75	hrs
08/16/2019	drafting of two witness subpoenas; correspondence to witnesses enclosing same for jury trial re Whaples; correspondence to Chief giving notice of jury trial re Whaples;	0.50	hrs
08/16/2019	receipt and review of correspondence from Chief re Dettmer file and correspondence to defense attorney re same;	0.25	hrs
08/16/2019	court appearance 301;	0.25	lus

Lakewood		PAGE	2
08/19/2019	review photos of scene; drafting of pretrial statement and motions in limine, direct exams re Whaples; correspondence with police department re new squad video needed; preparation for court in Room 301;	3.00	hrs
08/19/2019	post prep court call 301 Friday;	0.25	hrs
08/20/2019	correspondence to Attorney Thomas re plea offer re Harris;	0.25	hrs
08/20/2019	court appearance in Room 301;	0.50	hrs
08/21/2019	correspondence to officer giving notice of bench trial re Gibson;	0.25	hrs
08/21/2019	preparation for court in Room 104;	0.25	
08/22/2019	court appearance in Room 104;	0.50	
08/22/2019	preparation for 102 court on 8/23/19 re defendants, Frano and Kapustka;	0.75	
	• •	0.50	
08/23/2019	prepare for and court appearance in Room 301;	2.00	
08/23/2019	102 court appearance - plea call and bench trial negotiations for Frano and Kapustka;		
08/26/2019	drafting of template for ciations; drafting of memo re writing OV citations to Circuit Court; receipt and review of proposed ordinance re 102 Court;	2.50	hrs
08/28/2019	conference with witness re testimony for trial on October 15;	0.25	hrs
08/28/2019	prepare court call 104 am tomorrow;	0.25	
08/29/2019	court appearance 104 am; post prep court call 104 am;	1.00	hrs
08/29/2019	edit Memo re OV citatio; template citation f.rom;	1.00	hrs
08/29/2019	edit and memo re OV citation; template citation form	1.00	hrs
Total Fees For COSTS ADV 08/19/2019	VANCED Lakewood v. Richard Whaples -> Subpeona to Officer A. Danowski for Jury Trial;	\$2,781.25 \$6.80	
Total Disbur	sements For This Matter	\$6.80	
Matter 0	0013 Miscellaneous:		
08/05/2019	correspondence with Chief Administrative Officer re job application form in light of new laws re salary and criminal history; forward ban the box policy to Chief Administrative Officer re bank the box law requirements;	1.00	hrs
08/06/2019	correspondence with Chief Administrative Officer re job application form;	0.25	hrs
08/06/2019	conference with Chief Administrative Officer re inchoate rights of Village acquired in bankruptcy proceedings;	1.00	hrs
08/06/2019	telephone call from Chief Administrative Officer re various issues;	0.50	hrs
08/06/2019	receipt and review of correspondence from Chief Administrative Officer	0.25	hrs
00/00/2019	re "Loch Glen" property and piers;		
08/06/2019	conference with Village Clerk; follow up re same;	0.50	hrs
08/07/2019	correspondence with utility department re handling of foreclosure matters;	0.25	hrs
08/08/2019	conference with Chief, Clerk re enforcement issues; receipt and review of correspondence from Chief Administrative Officer; telephone call from Chief Administrative Officer re personnel; review cart agreement;	1.50	hrs
08/09/2019	receipt and review of correspondence from Chief Administrative Officer re Lazar Brother's attorney's request for additional time to prepare map of	3.25	hrs

Lakewood		PAGE	3
	parcel; analyze agreement with Turnberry Country Club, accompanying ordinances, easement agreement, deed; research assumption, ratification		
	of contract;	0.25	hrs
08/09/2019 08/09/2019	correspondence with staff re utilities, amounts due Village; analyze files re Turnberry Country Club dispute, related Turnberry documents; receipt and review of correspondence from Chief	1.50	
08/12/2019	Administrative Officer; respond thereto; telephone call with Chief Administrative Officer re FMLA and termination of employee; research termination issues during FMLA; receipt and review of discipline documents;	1.00	
08/12/2019	conference with Chief Administrative Officer; follow up re same; review of correspondence from Ted Adams' attorney, Village Clerk re citations; review Board packet;	0.75	
08/12/2019	correspondence with Chief Administrative Officer re water rights	0.25	
08/12/2019	telephone call from Lazar Brothers' attorney re due diligence deadilite	0.25	
08/13/2019	conferences with Chief Administrative Officer re FOIA request, agreement; receipt and review of correspondence from Chief	1.25	nrs
	Administrative Officer;		hrs
08/13/2019	attendance at Village Board meeting; special meeting;		hrs
08/13/2019	Duethorn offerney re status of legal description	0.25	hrs
08/16/2019	of usable parcel;	0.25	hrs
08/19/2019	drafting of extension letter for dates for survey, the	to entrary	
	Brothers contract; telephone call from Chief Administrative Officer;) hrs
08/20/2019	1.1 Trill Decardenti		hrs
08/21/2019	the City CA desiriet rative () Ifficer 18 Vallous Itolias,		hrs
08/21/2019	ti c Ollief Administrative Unicel, lollow up to phone out	2.00) hrs
08/22/2019	with Village President;	1.50) lus
08/23/2019	accompanying documents;	0.73	5 hrs
08/23/201	and sewerage revenue bonds; draft fillings of regular to file a petition, of bonds, notice of intent to issue bonds and right to file a petition, of bonds, notice of intent to issue bonds and right to file a petition,		
		1.0	0 hrs
08/23/201 08/26/201	in and review of correspondence from Lazar Brothers attends	0.2	5 hrs
00/20/201		1.2	5 hrs
08/27/201	attendance at town hall meeting; attendance at vinage Board meeting;	0.2	5 hrs
08/28/20	on foreclosure to Clerk, utility starr,	0.2	25 hrs
08/28/20	Lazar Brothers;	3.7	75 hrs
08/29/20	19 research re first amendment and social means, Administrative Officer re same;		

Lakewood			PAGE	4
08/30/2019 conference with Ciura attorney re proposed donation; receipt and review of correspondence from Ciura attorney, Chief Administrative Officer re		0.50	hrs	
08/30/2019	08/30/2019 conference with Chief Administrative Officer re zoning matter re variance; 08/30/2019 receipt and review of most recent extension letter from Lazar Brothers attorney;			hrs
08/30/2019				hrs
Total Fees F	or This Matter	29.50 hrs	\$5,162.50	
BILLING S	SUMMARY			
TOTAL FEES TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED		51.75 hrs	\$7,943.75 \$6.80	
(LESS	S PREPAID APPLIED) LL FOR THIS INVOICE		\$292.00 \$7,658.55	Cr
TOTA	AL BALANCE NOW DUE		\$7,658.55	

UNPAID BALANCES ARE SUBJECT TO A 1.5% PER MONTH DELINQUENCY CHARGE AFTER 30 DAYS FROM BILLING DATE. VISA AND MASTERCARD ACCEPTED.